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Editor’s note 
This note is produced by the KPMG Center for Healthcare Regulatory 
Insight and is intended to be short and succinct, less than 360 words, 
to provide a digestible bite of news relevant to our clients and 
practices. Links are provided to source material (proposed and final 
regulations, agency guidance and press releases, reports, research, 
etc.) when available.  

In order to continue receiving ATW 360 in future weeks, you will 
need to subscribe to our mailing list here. Please share this email 
with colleagues and other interested individuals. 

 

 
 

 

Healthcare regulatory news 

 
A CMS proposed rule would provide Part D plans new tools to 
lower prescription drug costs, including flexibility to manage 
“protected class” drug spending… CMS guidance illustrates 
examples of permissible 1332 waiver concepts… CMS announced a 
three-year program to improve patient safety and care quality in 
nursing homes… OIG found that CMS overpaid hospitals more than 
$140.5 million between 2014 and 2017, and recommended a wage 
index overhaul.  
 

  

https://info.kpmg.us/subscribe-to-kpmg-center-for-healthcare-regulatory-insights.html
https://s3.amazonaws.com/public-inspection.federalregister.gov/2018-25945.pdf
https://www.cms.gov/blog/proposed-changes-lower-drug-prices-medicare-advantage-and-part-d
https://www.cms.gov/blog/proposed-changes-lower-drug-prices-medicare-advantage-and-part-d
https://www.cms.gov/newsroom/fact-sheets/contract-year-cy-2020-medicare-advantage-and-part-d-drug-pricing-proposed-rule-cms-4180-p
https://www.cms.gov/newsroom/fact-sheets/contract-year-cy-2020-medicare-advantage-and-part-d-drug-pricing-proposed-rule-cms-4180-p
https://www.cms.gov/CCIIO/Programs-and-Initiatives/State-Innovation-Waivers/Downloads/Waiver-Concepts-Fact-Sheet.pdf
https://www.cms.gov/newsroom/press-releases/cms-launches-efforts-improve-patient-safety-quality-care-nursing-homes
https://www.cms.gov/Medicare/Provider-Enrollment-and-Certification/SurveyCertificationGenInfo/LTC-CMP-Reinvestment.html
https://oig.hhs.gov/oas/reports/region1/11700500.pdf
https://info.kpmg.us/subscribe-to-kpmg-center-for-healthcare-regulatory-insights.html


An investigation found that medical devices caused 83,000 deaths 
over the last decade, including more than a dozen FDA-approved 
devices for export to other countries… FDA announced efforts to 
modernize the 510(k) medical devices clearance pathway… FDA 
approved the first biosimilar for treatment of adult non-Hodgkin’s 
lymphoma. 
 
A long-delayed HRSA final rule will implement 340B ceiling prices 
and penalties on January 1… OMB is reviewing the 2020 ACA 
exchange proposed rule… CMS launched its “enhanced” direct 
enrollment pathway for ACA plans. 
 

 

   

 

Healthcare law and policy news 

 
ONC released a draft strategy on reducing regulatory and 
administrative burdens associated with use of EHRs and other 
health IT… CMS launched a tool to help consumers compare 
hospital and ambulatory surgical center procedure costs… 73% of 
SNFs will receive a penalty through the Value-based Purchasing 
Program for FY19 as a result of readmission rates. 
 
2.4 million Individuals have enrolled in healthcare.gov plans, 
down from 2.8 million last year… eHealth reported a significant 
increase in customers selecting short-term health plans over 
ACA-compliant plans… A Georgetown analysis found that the 
number of uninsured children increased in 2017 for the first time 
since 2008. 
 
CVS closed its $70 billion merger with Aetna, although a federal 
judge still must give final approval… Walgreens and Humana are 
considering strategic alliances… Amazon will begin selling 
software to analyze electronic health records… Apple is exploring 
giving veterans access to their medical records on iPhones… Teva 
released an EpiPen generic for $300 (same price as Mylan’s)… a 
data breach at Atrium Health could affect 2.65 million patients. 
 
CDC reported that US life expectancy dropped between 2016 and 
2017… A JAMA study found that 83% of telehealth utilization is 
from urban, not rural, populations… An AMA study found that 
73% of metropolitan areas have highly concentrated insurance 
markets. 

  
  

https://www.icij.org/investigations/implant-files/
https://www.nbcnews.com/health/health-care/exporting-pain-u-s-made-medical-devices-cause-serious-injuries-n939121
https://www.nbcnews.com/health/health-care/exporting-pain-u-s-made-medical-devices-cause-serious-injuries-n939121
https://www.fda.gov/NewsEvents/Newsroom/PressAnnouncements/ucm626572.htm
https://www.fda.gov/NewsEvents/Newsroom/PressAnnouncements/ucm627009.htm
https://s3.amazonaws.com/public-inspection.federalregister.gov/2018-26223.pdf
https://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/eoDetails?rrid=128687
https://www.reginfo.gov/public/do/eoDetails?rrid=128687
https://www.cms.gov/CCIIO/Programs-and-Initiatives/Health-Insurance-Marketplaces/Downloads/FAQs-EDE.pdf
https://www.cms.gov/CCIIO/Programs-and-Initiatives/Health-Insurance-Marketplaces/Downloads/FAQs-EDE.pdf
https://www.healthit.gov/topic/usability-and-provider-burden/strategy-reducing-burden-relating-use-health-it-and-ehrs
https://www.medicare.gov/procedure-price-lookup/
https://www.cms.gov/blog/you-have-right-know-price
https://data.medicare.gov/Nursing-Home-Compare/SNF-VBP-Facility-Level-Dataset/284v-j9fz
https://www.cms.gov/newsroom/fact-sheets/weekly-enrollment-snapshot-week-4
https://www.cms.gov/newsroom/fact-sheets/weekly-enrollment-snapshot-week-four
https://news.ehealthinsurance.com/_ir/68/201810/Open%20Enrollment%20for%202019%20Half-Time%20Report.pdf
https://news.ehealthinsurance.com/_ir/68/201810/Open%20Enrollment%20for%202019%20Half-Time%20Report.pdf
https://ccf.georgetown.edu/wp-content/uploads/2018/11/UninsuredKids2018_Final_asof1128743pm.pdf
https://www.wsj.com/articles/cvs-completes-70-billion-acquisition-of-aetna-1543423322
https://www.reuters.com/article/us-aetna-m-a-cvs-health/u-s-judge-raises-prospect-of-not-approving-cvs-aetna-deal-idUSKCN1NZ07S
https://www.reuters.com/article/us-aetna-m-a-cvs-health/u-s-judge-raises-prospect-of-not-approving-cvs-aetna-deal-idUSKCN1NZ07S
https://www.wsj.com/articles/walgreens-humana-are-in-preliminary-talks-to-take-stakes-in-each-other-1542746915
https://www.wsj.com/articles/amazon-starts-selling-software-to-mine-patient-health-records-1543352136
https://www.wsj.com/articles/amazon-starts-selling-software-to-mine-patient-health-records-1543352136
https://www.wsj.com/articles/apple-in-talks-to-give-veterans-access-to-electronic-medical-records-1542755703
https://www.cnbc.com/2018/11/27/teva-epipen-generic.html
https://www.healthcareitnews.com/news/atrium-health-breach-data-265m-patients-potentially-exposed
https://www.cdc.gov/nchs/products/databriefs/db328.htm
https://jamanetwork.com/journals/jama/article-abstract/2716547
https://www.ama-assn.org/sites/default/files/media-browser/competition-health-insurance-us-markets.pdf


 

 
 
Questions or comments, please send to us-hcinsight@kpmg.com  
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